
                       SALVAGE BID  TABULATION
Specification Number: F0998940003                                                                                                                                                                      Date: March 24, 2000

Project Description: SALVAGE TWENTY-SEVEN (27) VEHICLES

Bid Deposit: $    NONE                                                                                      Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                                       Contract Administrator: J. PICL 

Name of Bidder    Pg 1 Edca Auto Richards
Auto 

One Stop
Auto

T & B
Cartage

Illiana
Truck Parts

Al Guten-
schwager

Airline
Towing

L & L Auto
Parts

V & D Ideal
Auto

D C Sales Auto
Wholsalers

Bill Gill -
Vintage

SO3560 $55.00 $60.00 X X $251.00 X $90.00 $135.00 X X No Bid No Bid

SO3867 X $75.00 X X $401.00 X $125.00 $135.00 $259.59 $387.00

PL0818 $55.00 $60.00 $100.00 X X X $107.00 $117.00 X X

EN0102 X $60.00 X X X X $60.00 $95.00 X X

SO3550 $67.00 $60.00 X X $251.00 X $60.00 $95.00 X X

PV2035 $55.00 $60.00 X X X X $60.00 $95.00 X X

SO3857 $55.00 $155.00 X X $401.00 X X X $329.00 $587.00

PV2029 $151.00 X X X X X X X X X

DT0049 $126.00 $60.00 X X $251.00 X $80.00 $110.00 X X

SO3516 $50.00 $51.00 X X $251.00 X $90.00 $110.00 X X

I2605 X X X X X X x X X X

EN0111 X $75.00 X X $401.00 X $125.00 $140.00 $159.59 X

PV2053 $201.00 $261.00 $100.00 X $301.00 X $125.00 $138.00 $329.59 X

AC8912 $126.00 $110.00 X X X X $105.00 $138.00 X X

SO3511 X X X X $251.00 X $110.00 $105.00 X X

AC0800 $176.00 $60.00 $100.00 X $251.00 $517.00 $80.00 $118.00 $229.59 X

PV0021 $26.00 X X X X X $70.00 X X X  

HS0114 $26.00 $51.00 X X $251.00 X $97.00 $118.00 X X

S03566 X X X X $251.00 X X X X X



                       SALVAGE BID  TABULATION
Specification Number: F0998940003                                                                                                                                                                      Date: March 24, 2000

Project Description: SALVAGE TWENTY-SEVEN (27) VEHICLES

Bid Deposit: $    NONE                                                                                      Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                                       Contract Administrator: J. PICL 

Name of Bidder    Pg 2 Edca Auto Richards
Auto 

One Stop
Auto

T & B
Cartage

Illiana
Truck Parts

Al Guten-
schwager

Airline
Towing

L & L Auto
Parts

V & D Ideal
Auto

D C Sales Auto
Wholsalers

Bill Gill -
Vintage

FM2045 $251.00 $566.00 $100.00 $500.00 $401.00 $357.00 $170.00 $228.00 $329.00 $777.00

BH0012 $26.00 X X X X X $25.00 X X X No Bid No Bid

CB0009 $26.00 X X X X X $75.00 X X X

EN0107 $76.00 X X X $251.00 X $90.00 $118.00 X X

GS1232 X $75.00 X X $101.00 X $75.00 X X X

HS0100 $126.00 $201.00 X X $251.00 X $75.00 $105.00 X X

SO3886 $155.00 $505.00 X $500.00 $401.00 X $170.00 $328.00 $329.00 $687.00

INSPG65 X X X X X X $60.00 $89.00 X X



                       SALVAGE BID  TABULATION
Specification Number: F0998940003                                                                                                                                                                      Date: March 24, 2000

Project Description: SALVAGE TWENTY-SEVEN (27) VEHICLES

Bid Deposit: $    NONE                                                                                      Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                                       Contract Administrator: J. PICL 

Name of Bidder    Pg 3 Derby Hill 
Equip.

Arthur Kidd Ed Rus

SO3560 No Bid No Bid No Bid

SO3867

PL0818

EN0102

SO3550

PV2035

SO3857

PV2029

DT0049

SO3516

I2605

EN0111

PV2053

AC8912

SO3511

AC0800

PV0021

HS0114

S03566



                       SALVAGE BID  TABULATION
Specification Number: F0998940003                                                                                                                                                                      Date: March 24, 2000

Project Description: SALVAGE TWENTY-SEVEN (27) VEHICLES

Bid Deposit: $    NONE                                                                                      Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                                       Contract Administrator: J. PICL 

Name of Bidder    Pg 4 Derby Hill 
Equip.

Arthur Kidd Ed Rus

FM2045 No Bid No Bid No Bid

BH0012

CB0009

EN0107

GS1232

HS0100

SO3886

INSPG65

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications .  
City of Chicago   Department of Purchases, Contracts & Supplies
Richard M. Daley, Mayor David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer 


