
SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F2998940026                                                                                                                                              Date: January 6, 2003

Project Description: VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator: J. Picl 

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 1 Hoekstra &
Sons, Inc.

Richards Auto
Sales

Auto
Wholesalers

RKD Auto
Sales

Tom McIntosh Derby Hill
Equipment

DC Sales HELP Erickson
Trucks-N-

Parts

Ideal Auto Ent.
Inc.

Patricia
Trucking

WISCAN, LLC.

AVAS32 NO BID NO BID NO BID X X X X $541.51 $211.11 $669.00 $178.00 $1,567.56

AVAS40 X X X X $434.71 $261.11 $1,069.00 $285.00 $2,064.67

AVAS41 X X X X $471.41 $411.11 $1,069.00 $285.00 $2,253.79

AVAS42 X X X X $506.94 $261.11 $1,069.00 $280.00 $2,652.75

AVC029 X X X X $497.41 $131.11 $429.00 $158.00 X

AVC065 X X X X $341.07 $131.11 $429.00 $158.00 X

AVC092 X X X X X $631.11 X X $157.87

AVM070 X X $1,269.00 $751.00 $456.07 $611.11 X X X

AVM071 X X $1,279.00 $751.00 $507.31 $811.11 X X X

AVPD26 X X X X X $31.11 X X X

AVPD31 $800.00 $1,089.75 X X X $161.11 $469.00 X X

AVPD35 X $1,377.75 X X X $211.11 $469.00 X X

AVPD36 $800.00 X X X X $261.11 $469.00 X X

AVPD55 X X X X X $321.11 X X X

AVPW03 X X X X $10.19 $31.11 $69.00 X $80.55

AVS107 X X $10,569.00 X X $8,611.11 X X X

AVS111 X X $9,569.00 X X $7,611.11 X X $1,679.58

AVS215 X X $6,569.00 $2,307.00 $3,017.14 $2,611.11 $1,069.00 X $3,167.77



SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F2998940026                                                                                                                                              Date: January 6, 2003

Project Description: VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator: J. Picl 

NAME OF BIDDER         PG. 2 Hoekstra &
Sons, Inc.

Richards Auto
Sales

Auto
Wholesalers

RKD Auto
Sales

Tom McIntosh Derby Hill
Equipment

DC Sales HELP Erickson
Trucks-N-

Parts

Ideal Auto Ent.
Inc.

Patricia
Trucking

WISCAN, LLC.

AVS406 NO BID NO BID NO BID X X $3,569.00 X X $2,781.11 X X X

AVSP84 X X $269.00 X X $121.11 X X X

AVV004 X X $53.00 X $51.26 $41.11 X X $80.55

AVV005 X X $53.00 X $51.26 $31.11 X X $80.55

FIRE#1 X X X X X $1,131.11 X X X

FIRE#2 X X X $501.00 X $331.11 X X X

P/BLO#1 X X $469.00 X X $121.11 X X X

P/BLO#2 X X $469.00 X X $161.11 X X $180.54

PT/LIFT X X X $377.00 $557.41 $311.11 X X $269.97



SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F2998940026                                                                                                                                              Date: January 6, 2003

Project Description: VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator: J. Picl 

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 3 Police MMD Vintage
Vehicles &
Parts Inc.

AVAS32 X X

AVAS40 X X

AVAS41 X X

AVAS42 X X

AVC029 X X

AVC065 X X

AVC092 X X

AVM070 X X

AVM071 X X

AVPD26 X X

AVPD31 $1,020.00 X

AVPD35 $1,775.00 X

AVPD36 $1,555.00 X

AVPD55 X X

AVPW03 X X

AVS107 X $504.00



SALVAGE  TABULATION

Specification Number: F2998940026                                                                                                                                              Date: January 6, 2003

Project Description: VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                     Contract Administrator: J. Picl 

AVS111 X $504.00

NAME OF BIDDER           PG. 4 Police MMD Vintage
Vehicles &
Parts Inc.

AVS215 X X

AVS406 X $504.00

AVSP84 X X

AVV004 X X

AVV005 X X

FIRE#1 X X

FIRE#2 X X

P/BLO#1 X X

P/BLO#2 X X

PT/LIFT X X

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.
City of ChicagoCity of Chicago       Department of Procurement ServicesDepartment of Procurement Services
Richard M. Daley, MayorRichard M. Daley, Mayor David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer 


